PURCHASING AND CENTRAL SERVICES

Telephone No.: (845) 808-1088 FaxNo.: (845) 808-1914

Title: . CAST IRON FRAMES‘ AND GRATES
Contract Period: JANUARY 1, 2018 — DECEMBER 31, 2018
Bid Opening Date: ~ January 10, 2018

BID No: RFB-02-18

Authorized User: County Agencies, All Political Subdivisions
Descripi:ion: ‘CAST IRON FRAMES AND GRATES

Vendor Information: Expanded Supply
3330 Route 9
Cold Spring, NY 10516
845-265-3771
Carmel Winwater
86 Fair Street
Carmel, NY 10512
845-228-4086

PURCHASING AGENT:. Mf W

pate: _//22//1&

-

DEPARTMENT HEAD: )g“)“"&\ S pate: /[ %3]/8
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RFB-02-18

CAST IRON FRAMES GRATES

CAMPBELL GLENCO EXPANDED CARMEL
FOUNDRY SUPPLY, INC. SUPPLY WINWATER
DESCRIPTION PATTERN 845-490-4203 845-265-3771 845-228-4G98
NUMBER
CURB TYPE FRAME AND GRATE

36.‘ x 54'.

UNIT PRICE EACH 2617 $400.00 $398.00 $400.00
48'. x 54.'

UNIT PRICE EACH 2618 $525.00 $494.00 $494.00
42" X 54"

UNIT PRICE EACH 2639 no bid $548.00 $545.00

FLAT TYPE FRAME AND GRATE

24" X 24"

UNIT PRICE EACH 2814 $184.00 $80.00 $80.00
30" X 30"

UNIT PRICE EACH 2815 $23500 | $164.00 |  $157.00
36" X 36"

UNIT PRICE EACH 2816 no bid $230.00 $195.00

36" X 55 172"

UNIT PRICE EACH 3408 $395.00 $376.00 $374.00
51 n x 54"

UNIT PRICE EACH 3425 $591.00 $594.00 $590.00

BID TERM

JANUARY 1, 2016 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

8ID RESULTS



RFB-02-18

CAST IRON FRAMES GRATES

CAMPBELL GLENCO EXPANDED CARMEL
FOUNDRY SUPPLY, INC. SUPPLY WINWATER
DESCRIPTION PATTERN 845-265-3771
NUMBER
MANHOLE FRAME AND COVER
4" x 2 "
UNIT PRICE EACH 1009A $190.00 $175.00 $164.00
6" x 24"
UNIT PRICE EACH 10098 $215.00 $210.00 $225.00
4" x 30"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1012D $248.00 $248.00 $265.00
6" x 30"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1012A $301.00 $303.00 $300.00
MANHOLE FRAME AND GRATE
4II x 2 L1}
UNIT PRICE EACH 1182B $145.00 $144.00 $144.00
4" x 30"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1187D no bid $254.00 $255.00
6" x 24"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1182¢ $180.00 $179.00 $179.00
6" x 30"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1187A no bid $299.00 $299.00

BID TERM

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

BID RESULTS



RFB-02-18

CAST IRON FRAMES GRATES

CAMPBELL GLENCO EXPANDED CARMEL
FOUNDRY SUPPLY, INC. SUPPLY WINWATER
DESCRIPTION | PATTERN 845-265-3771
NUMBER
MANHOLE EXTENSION RINGS

1ll x 24“

UNIT PRICE EACH $80.00 $75.00 $53.00
2“ x 2 [ 1)

UNIT PRICE EACH $82.00 $45.00 $45.00
1" x 30"

UNIT PRICE EACH no bid $150.00 $145.00
2" x 30"

UNIT PRICE EACH no bid $165.00 $160.00
1" x 36"

UNIT PRICE EACH no bid $204.00 $195.00
2" x 36"

UNIT PRICE EACH no bid $214.00 $205.00

MANHOLE FRAME AND COVER
(SLAB TYPE)

4" x 24"

UNIT PRICE EACH 1718 no bid $204.00 $191.00

BID TERM

JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2018

BID RESULTS



RFB-02-18 CAST IRON FRAMES GRATES BID RESULTS

CAMPBELL | GLENCO EXPANDED CARMEL
FOUNDRY | SUPPLY, INC. SURPLY WINWATER
DESCRIPTION PATTERN 245.265-3771
NUMBER
6" x 2 L1}
UNIT PRICE EACH 1728 no bid $360.00 no bid
4" x 30"
UNIT PRICE EACH 17189 no bid $254.00 $255.00
6" x 30"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1729 no bid $495.00 no bid
4" x 36"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1720 no bid 4 $395.00 $395.00
6" x 36"
UNIT PRICE EACH 1730 no bid $949.00 no bid
4" x 42"
" UNIT PRICE EACH 1721 no bid $1,369.00 no bid
6" x 42
UNIT PRICE EACH 1731 no bid $1,369.00 no bid
LOW B I D Bid General Foundry

81D TERM JANUARY 1, 2018 - DECEMBER 31, 2013




